p%e ////

XV/ /( \v\\\ o | -

o
’\To EDN-A- Ka(3)—22/"009 .
~ Gov ernment of Himachal Pradesh ‘
‘ »Depa.rtment of Higher Education % 4
From - i |
i The Pnnc1pa1 Secretary (Hr. Educatmn) to the . : 5 < '{
Go\fermnent of Hnnachal Pradesh. . Fos s . ‘
- .. TO : - ~ z £ 5 = > ' % - - “
: : ~ : /ﬁeRegzbtrar : - . S
= Bl o ~The Shoolini University of Bmtechnology and Management
& % : -Sciences, Solan,” ’ - ¢
B : H.P;., Distt. Solan, ' ' ’ :
e ' Himachai Pradesh.
: ; rw \ i ..
_Dated Shimla-b the . o [)‘ February, 2011.
Subject: Regardmg the Shoohm Unive rs:ty of Bmtechnology and F
 Management Sclenc% (Establishment and Regulation) ?
% Amendment Act, "010 (Act No. 11 0f2011). |
" Sir, :
A i am dlrected to refer to the, subject cited above and to say that the
< - Shoolini Umversm of Bmtechnoloov and Management Stiences (Establishment |
' and Regulanor) Amendment Ayt 2010 (Act No. 1 of ”Ol 1) has been notﬁed :
ok e bv the State Governmem(copy enclosed). - : :
v B - Now are, therefore, requested to take necessary actlon accordmgﬁy
; and action taken repoﬁ may be sent to thlS department 1mmedla{e ly: Copy of this
Act. can also be dcw nioaded from the Himacha} Pradesh Government website
ie. http //admis. hp nic. m*nonﬁc@efaultz aspx. :
Yours faxthﬁxllv
- Add -Secret(ry’
- Government of_
& i
g



B oo e v

- This is a digitally signed gazette, to verify click here.

NEEE R IR

= Riel, IR, 28 WA, 2011 /8 WY, 1932~ - -

' - Rmer—2, 27 5799, 20117
. GYET: _Wowowo—@o(é)—_,ae /20105 —fFATael Uoe ) U, YRGB |
P BT 200 P I Faw TIE BT FAT GRS Y RN 22—1-2011 B AR orE
Y<¥T 9TENT faTafieney (v ok fafigEe) Rege, 2010 (2010 &1 fERw RS 23) BT a9

2011 & RIFRE WE=ie 2 & w9 § GREE @ orweT 348 (8) ® oM e oS Wit
U1 T fEATereT yewr IGUH (SNERY) ¥ YR By 2 : '

-

; g
AR I ST,

afzra (fafe) |

2239193 / 2011—28—1—2011 _ (8319)



: Wwwmﬁwﬁﬁmﬁéwﬁﬁmﬁwﬁw(ww&ﬁ?ﬁﬁww}w@ﬁw
'2009(2009%%%20)@%@@%%,1 ‘

P amswm#ﬂ—q%:ﬁmﬁéwaﬁﬁwﬁ%ﬁewmﬁﬁm@m

(@)



| : . %

8374 _ X99A, fRErEe gewn, 28 SHA9), 2010 /8 HIE, 1932 @ ' :

& wrs (xix) # Rralorem @ yaeE ik Seovdl @ v @M, SuER @l
HIETT YT HRAT T o<l 3R e & W R “Ha—Udr ok et @
R¥ara =M, SUER 3R SFe™ Ui e @on Rvafees @yl 8k
Sl & foe” e @ik R W@ o | ‘

3. ngﬂ%ﬁaﬂ.—a\aaﬁﬁwaﬁwezﬁm(H)ﬁ”a?ﬂﬁﬁ,"gﬁaaﬁ?%%
%Wsﬁ?aﬁmﬁﬁw—ﬁmaﬁ?wzﬁwwsﬁ?ﬁ%ﬁ@ﬂﬁmm
e ‘ _ | ,

T amzemﬁsﬁéﬂ.—{aafﬁﬁawaﬁwzaaﬁww(1)2%@178({6)qu
ﬁv—mm! ; ,

5. érm31afrﬁ¥ﬁa?.—ﬁaar@ﬁwaﬁwa1aﬁw (4) & Tenq Freferfaa
S SUHRT 3T RN & S, srerfq — .

“(6) faaferers, yearqadt auf # feE weTER § T ol @ g 3 B
fore a1 v urgEEn yRet v @ fog, o yE @ g R ey R 9
RIwIRe @ szl B, Wo8 WReBR $1 g ergAeT W | AE i O @
BT @ 9 BT YA RT O q& ar) R | |

6. ORI 32 B WA~ JRFTH &) oRT 32 § < TP A SEi—oTw A
B B WH R AN A e e | , |

2 W4omﬂ'¥ha=r.—a§raﬁﬁmaﬁwma%ww(1)'ﬁ"wﬁrﬁﬁwﬁ
@ TR WRT BT A9 AT S | :

8. URT 41 BT WM~ FRT 3 aR 41 B SUERT @) B WReqEd § “UE
T TeE] B I W TN g I W/ Oe | -

AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

ACT NO. 11 OF 2011

THE SHOOLINI UNIVERSITY OF BIOTECHNOLOGY AND MANAGEMENT
SCIENCES (ESTABLISHMENT AND REGULATION) AMENDMENT
ACT, 2010 . :

(AS ASSENTED TO BY THE GOVERNOR ON 22ND JANUARY, 201 1)

AN =
" TR
~ ACT

to -amend the Shoolini University of Biotechnology and Management Sciences
(Establishment and Regulation) Act, 2009 (Act No. 20 of 2009). ' .

~ BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the Sixty-first Year of
the Republic of India as follows:— :



o1, f2Amre g, 28 STaN], 2010 /8 HIH, 1932 - 8375

1. Short title.—This Act may be called the Shoolini University of Biotechnology and
Management Sciences (Establishment and Regulation) Amendment Act, 2010.

22 Amendment of section 5.—In section 5 of the Shoolini University of
Biotechnology and Management Sciences (Establishment and Regulatlon) Act, 2009 (20 of 2009)
(hereinafter referred to as the “principal Act”),—

(a) clause (vii), shall be omitted.;
(b) after clause (xi), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(xi-a) the sponsoring body/university shall appoint full time regular
employees for the university and the salary of the employees shall be deposited in
the bank account of the employees every month;™;

(©) for clause(xviii), the following clause shall be substitilted, namely:—

“(xviil) to set-up colleges, institutions, off-campus centres,
off-shore campus, study centres or to start distance education, after fulfilling
the norms and regulations of the Central Government Regulatory Bodies and

= Central Government, issued from time to time, and after obtaining the
specific approval of the State Government;”; and

(d) in clause (xix) after the words “and grants”, the words “except from parents and
students™ shall be inserted.

5 Amendment of section 9.—In section 9 of the principal Act, in clause (d), after the
word and sign “donation,”, the words and 31gn “except from parents and students,” shall be
inserted. -

4. Amendment of section 26.—In section 26 of the principal Aci, in sub-section(1),

clause (g) shall be omitted.

5. Amendment of section 31.—In section 31 of the principal Act, after sub-section
(4), the following new sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

> . yzf&”:T ~ “(5) The University shall seek prior approval of the State Government for
? ('G-A,%ﬂ“ : admitting new students in subsequent years in the existing courses or for starting
,V"']f- : new courses which shall be subject to recommendations of the inspection committee
set up for the purpose. This shall be applicable till the first batch of final year
students are admitted.”.

= 6. Amendment of section 32.—In section 32 of the principal Act, for the words “one
month” wherever these occur, the words “three months” shall be substituted.

% Amendment of section 40.—In section 40 of the principal Act, in sub- sectlon (D),
the words and signs “after consultation with the Vice- Chancellor » shall be omitted.

8. Amendment of section 41.—In section 41 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),
in the proviso, for the words “fifteen years”, the words “twenty five years” shall be substituted.



